T 0l @)

PRy
g3 “'rw
smrus :ozd =3
samgé’c NPT TY

samq’éc (Slatid: 11
TRFIT TNy 301 (SH=B) JPgeows, 2017
(20178 QSRR Dgieodd Tos5-20)

FOOFE3T  B00WNE 301 @HAIDR, 1957, IR, SHBR  JPEL 20T
AlnlJow;. 2

[Y A, W00 FOWWDS VG eBNYTON FJprwT FpTWNRY IO LRI,
19573, (19573 B0Fess WHACHD 25) DHIW), IR SRR CWOFHNDFTOOT;

oV ALIeT Sy gtclepi ksl 00BZouSe JIRFBY FDOF LT Oo% DFOTDOBONOT B4
BOODT0Z WPICDNTONSZT:~

1. Bo3y IR DB TPoy.- (1) 38 WPRICHXDBD, BooFEs Jevewney  3on
(3HTR) LHICDT, 2017 20T FEOLIZY,

(2) <o, OO, ITWFTRY, WHRPUSCD RS, RABDTBRWTOE  ©OF

DTOTTORD 0N WTIZT,
2. SUBRSe ITAUCH STHIB.- FTOFWF [PoNY 0K LRI, 195709
(195738 BFtas ©RIOHT 25) (VY ANF/VOT RV LHICTWOR HVZeLDBLON),~

(i) gon “20” BY, B Mo, 1289, ()¢ @ BoWORRT  IRNGY (3)3e
©0BREY  “Besmo mmg D0V IO “3esmo magém” DOW ajdmfabd
TSR TII);

(i) n “2” B, 3D 3 Ro&s, 589, (1AV)Se 500 T0W0HAT IZRTONG 300,
B BROOITI, Nea:sssﬁcs% QOTT:—

“(v) Bp¥Eoing 3“hs—‘§ DO (2 2B) BB BOTOWRHS”
B BOTX i*ﬂﬁf B (ADT')
wﬁriraocs ée;‘ﬂs-‘s CI)

3. YT oDTRBAL SWIR.- RV VRICDIDT YT VPRRWODY, B o, 8 I
(HBe oz “Bezm QDIOVNEIA ITRER “Besmo  ATT D0V TTNEIY,
@aoiraeaz:ss@d%.



2

NN D) TN Bewd

BRLS’, BRET BEA®, B3[BT LIFFEDT AOFI, e o D) JANFE wdUT
Boees 3OO, BIT TOXPD), AFFOIWTTT  DJPOTOOT DRHIT. ©QoRTIR
DB, © IVTODRF), B8 em%ﬁ%mf TRTUIT e 3@??033:63% @@‘Jb@déﬁ Obuém?rﬁ,
VHTTIWIT. SWTO0T, TIoFET =o0oNe 301 WHICD, 19578 (19578 FJoress
©HICHID 25) SMHTA TR ©TFFFow SORE3RONT.

STBOOT, B3 DGICODE.



URFY 1PTI TF

TRNE ToATFT Ty 03P BPS BT, LERPOBVRDY.

-0

2T TRTHO%,
B0

DT, Dwesr
FoONF TS (J)
BTIOF BT oS BY



ODWOGP
o [WRTvWNY S0R WRPIDHTH 1957T8 (19578 FTords WPICHD 25) e’oc.jw 2 Pon

XX XX XX
QOERe MR
53)(®) BFTRE ©wR0HY TERGEY BIRTO wFHe |OOUS FWPNZ  [[OCNTT

WS DOTVWVTOT WOTD @OIT OR0N FITOUT FNEODT TN,

3 R0, JONG ARV 30N &9
1 2 ‘ 3
XX XX XX
Pt Q0
L 0D03RETITED, F0TT,~
XX XX XX
12.  2RciR0T 208N 2068,
(1) BTV YOTT wIRR0BOZ Bedpes* 3eBwo RRTB
XX XX XX
ot &
5. Bdredodo OIT[ R 0T3,-
(1) VTO? (DENT?) 3e8@o BT
XX XX XX
(iv) =3 3esm TS0
XX XX XX

mgdc [OepIctx]
5(4)3e B30T ©BR0IY APRVIVTT 301 FOWOFTIT e ITBNWD

3D o, AOBNS BT DPRT WO 301 ©o
(1) (2) ©) (4)
XX XX XX
8. deom oowng  3on B WRHAIODINT wR0DY 301K Besm Joey

ORI 19568 143¢ BHBNOCIT ToRBYS BRTO
Teores (iiv)  DoEmg @ WFW®  Bwous  Fen3
DOFFIRROVROY Bogp Fo  SPTVWOT VT BITY

XX XX XX

XToFO SNTFHOCDH, AFI NG PuE, Bondet, &7, R 192, -TAsd 1000, 63 I 2017



Gexial Mo, @

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA SALES TAX (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2017
(L.A. Bill No. 20 of 2017)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Sales Tax Act.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Sales Tax Act,

1957 (Karnataka Act 25 of 1957) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty-eighth

year of the Republic of India, as follows.-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Sales Tax (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may be

notification, appoint.

2. Amendment to second schedule.- In the second schedule of the
Karnataka Sales Tax Act, 1957 (Karnataka Act 25 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to
as the principal Act),-

(i) in Part “M”, in serial number 12, in the entries relating to item (i), in
column (3), for the words "thirty percent”, the words "thirty-five percent” shall be
substituted;

(1) in Part “P”, in serial number 5, after the entries relating to item (iv), the

following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(v) Natural Gas including Piped Natural Fourteen and one half
Gas (PNG) and Compressed Natural percent”
Gas (CNQG)

3. Amendment of fourth schedule.- In the fourth schedule of the principal
Act, in serial number 8, in column (4), for the words "four percent”, the words "five

percent” shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Tax on petrol, high speed diesel, aviation turbine fuel, crude oil and natural
gas shall be levied from a date that the GST Council may decide. Till then and even
after that, States will be empowered to levy tax on sale of these products. Hence, it
is considered to amend the Karnataka Sales Tax Act, 1957 (Karnataka Act 25
of 1957).

Hence, the Bill.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.

SIDDARAMAIAH
CHIEF MINISTER

S. Murthy
Secretary (I/¢)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA SALES TAX ACT, 1957
(KARNATAKA ACT 25 OF 1957)

XXX XXX XXX
SECOND SCHEDULE
Goods on the sale of which a single point tax is leviable on the first or earliest of
successive dealers in the State under section 5(3)(a)

Sl.No. Description of goods Rate of Tax
1 2 3
p.9.9.4 XXX p.9.9.4
PART M
1. Machinery, that is to say,—
XXX XXX XXX
12. Motor spirits, that is to say,—
(i) Petrol including aviation fuel Thirty percent.
p.9.9.4 XXX XXX
PART P
S.Petroleum products, namely,—
(1) Asphalt (bitumen) Sixteen percent
XXX XXX XXX
(iv) Naptha Twelve percent
XXX XXX XXX

FOURTH SCHEDULE

Declared goods in respect of which tax is leviable under section 5(4).

Sl. No. Description of the goods Point of levy Rate of tax
(1) (2) (3) (4)
XXX XXX XXX
8. Crude oil as specified Sale by the first or Four percent
in clause (iic) of section earliest of successive
14 of the Central Sales dealers in the State
Tax Act, 1956. liable to tax under
this Act.
XXX XXX XXX

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha Unit, Bengaluru 6% June, 2017 P7, W.D.192, Copies 1000



